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Supplemental Nutrition Assistance Program 
participation during the economic recovery of 2003 to 
2007

The existing studies have all focused on reasons for the ag-
gregate caseload increase, but have not explored participa-
tion at the individual level. In this article I summarize my 
study, which looks for the cause of the increase in SNAP 
participation at its underlying source: the determinants of 
the participation decision at the individual level, including 
the dynamics of SNAP entry and exit.7 Before examining the 
dynamics of SNAP participation, I describe the significant 
policy changes that may have influenced whether or not 
individuals chose to participate in SNAP.

SNAP policy changes

There have been a number of changes to SNAP policy dur-
ing the last decade. The 2002 Farm Bill gave states much 
more flexibility over the eligibility requirements for their 
SNAP programs. Following the passage of this bill, many 
states began to align the eligibility requirements for SNAP 
with those for other programs such as Temporary Assistance 
for Needy Families (TANF) and Supplemental Security In-
come (SSI). Most of these changes were aimed at making it 
easier to apply and qualify for the SNAP program, such as 
combined applications, decreased asset requirements, and 
simplified definitions of income and deductions. However, 
many changes also affected those already receiving SNAP 
benefits, and could have affected how long an individual 
remained a program participant. These policies include more 
flexible reporting requirements, longer certification periods, 
and expanded categorical eligibility. 

Reporting requirements 

States now have the option of requiring SNAP recipients to 
report on their income and finances at various intervals and 
in various ways. They may institute a type of periodic report-
ing system or they may rely on households to report changes 
within 10 days of occurrence, known as “incident reporting.” 
Under the periodic system, participants report either quarter-
ly or monthly, or under a “simplified” system with reduced 
reporting requirements. Under the simplified reporting op-
tion, households are required to report changes in income 
between certification and scheduled reporting periods only 
when total countable income rises above 130 percent of the 
poverty level. States implementing simplified reporting may 
set reporting intervals at four, five, or six months. Prior to 
passage of the 2002 Farm Bill, SNAP (then called the Food 
Stamp program) had the option to use a reporting system 
with reduced reporting requirements for earned-income 

Janna Johnson

Janna Johnson is a graduate student in Public Policy at the 
Harris School, University of Chicago.

The recent sharp rise in Supplemental Nutrition Assistance 
Program (SNAP)

 
participants has received much attention in 

the press and from policymakers.1 Since the start of the Great 
Recession in December 2007, SNAP participation

 
has in-

creased to its highest level ever, serving 40.3 million Ameri-
cans each month, more than 13 percent of the population, in 
fiscal year 2010.2 Less attention has been given to the fact 
that SNAP participation also increased during the preceding 
economic expansion. Between fiscal years 2003 and 2007, 
total SNAP participation increased from 21 million to 27 
million, an increase of almost 30 percent. This rise marked 
the first time in the program’s history that participation in-
creased during a period of economic recovery and growth. 

Many studies have documented the relationship between 
macroeconomic conditions and SNAP participation levels. 
The majority of these studies find that the unemployment 
rate and other macroeconomic conditions have accounted for 
a large share of the changes in SNAP participation.3 Given 
this historical relationship, one would have expected SNAP 
participation to have fallen by about 6 percent during the 
economic expansion of 2003 to 2007.4 Instead, participation 
increased by over 20 percent.

The fact that participation in SNAP behaved contrary to ex-
pectations based on the economic conditions during this time 
period has prompted researchers to seek explanations for the 
increase. A recent report prepared for the U.S. Department 
of Agriculture found that the increase in participation in 
the early 2000s (when the economy was in recession) can 
be accounted for by an increase in the number of individu-
als eligible for the program, while the increase during the 
recovery period was due to an increase in the participation 
rate among those eligible.5 The authors attribute the increase 
in the eligible population to changes in state unemployment, 
labor force participation rates, and minimum wages; and 
the increase in the participation rate among those eligible 
to changes in the unemployment rate and changes in SNAP 
policy. Another study came to a similar conclusion, that 
the increase in participation between 2000 and 2008 can be 
explained by a combination of economic factors and policy 
changes.6
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households on a semi-annual schedule. With passage of the 
Farm Bill’s simplified reporting option, states may expand 
their reporting systems for earned-income households to 
any and all households that can be asked to report periodi-
cally.8 During the 2000s, many states did switch to simplified 
reporting, as well as to longer reporting intervals and fewer 
reporting requirements. 

Certification periods

With simplified reporting, states have the option of choosing 
how long a household is certified to receive SNAP. At the 
end of the period, a household must recertify their eligibility 
for the program to keep receiving benefits. Certification pe-
riods are assigned by caseworkers and are usually based on 
household characteristics and income. Certification periods 
became longer after implementation of the 2002 Farm Bill; 
by 2007, most states were assigning certification periods of 
12 months or longer. 

Expanded categorical eligibility

Regular participation-based categorical eligibility makes 
anyone who is currently certified to receive TANF or SSI 
benefits automatically eligible to receive SNAP. States can 
choose to offer optional expanded categorical eligibility, 
which additionally makes households that receive benefits 
or services through programs that are at least 50 percent 
funded by TANF or maintenance-of-effort sources eligible 
for SNAP. Note that for many of these services the only 
requirement for eligibility is to have income less than 200 

percent of the poverty line, which is higher than the 130 
percent requirement for SNAP eligibility. 

The dynamics of SNAP participation

I now attempt to identify the reason for the SNAP participa-
tion increase during the economic recovery of 2003 to 2007. 
I first describe three potential mechanisms for the increase, 
then use a descriptive analysis to identify which of these is 
the likely cause.

Potential mechanisms for a caseload increase

At the individual level, there are three mechanisms by which 
SNAP participation can increase: an increase in the number 
of individuals eligible for the program, an increase in the rate 
at which individuals enter the program, and a decrease in the 
rate at which participants exit the program. 

When considering which of these three mechanisms to be 
the most likely cause of the increase in SNAP participation 
during the 2003 to 2007 recovery, it is important to keep 
in mind that this recovery was atypical. Economic growth, 
while positive, was quite low, and the unemployment rate 
did not fall very much as a result. The historical relationship 
between the unemployment rate and the percentage of the 
population participating in SNAP since 1980 can be seen 
in Figure 1. The shaded areas on the figure indicate periods 
of official recession (as determined by the National Bureau 
of Economic Research). Here it is apparent that prior to 
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Figure 1. SNAP Participation, Poverty, and Unemployment Rates, 1980–2010.

Source: Bureau of Labor Statistics, U.S. Department of Agriculture, and U.S. Census data.

Note: Shading indicates periods of recession, as determined by the National Bureau of Economic Research.
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the 2000s the unemployment rate and SNAP participation 
moved in tandem.9 

Figure 1 also illustrates a unique feature of the economic 
recovery of 2003 to 2007; that the poverty rate did not fall 
during that period. During a typical economic recovery 
period, we would expect the number of individuals eligible 
for SNAP to fall, since overall incomes tend to rise with 
economic growth. We would also expect the rate at which 
individuals enter the program to fall, and the exit rate from 
SNAP to rise. As noted above, however, the 2003 to 2007 
recovery was not typical, and the expected patterns did not 
occur. 

Descriptive analysis results

To find out which of these three mechanisms behaved differ-
ently than expected and therefore could be identified as the 
likely cause of the increase in SNAP participation between 
2003 and 2007, I used the Survey of Income and Program 
Participation (SIPP), a nationally-representative panel 
survey containing detailed information on households and 
individuals in the United States at a monthly level.10 Figure 
2 shows the monthly participation rate in SNAP calculated 
using all individuals in the SIPP data. It follows the official 
participation rate very closely, starting at around 7 percent 
of the population in early 2001, and rising throughout the 
period to over 13 percent in early 2010. The two shaded areas 
mark the 2001 recession and the Great Recession. During 

the recovery period of 2003 to 2007, the participation rate 
rose from around 8 percent to near 10 percent, although the 
SIPP data shows some evidence that it may have declined 
somewhat in 2007. 

The first potential mechanism by which SNAP participation 
could rise is an increase in the number of those eligible for 
the program. Eligibility for SNAP is primarily income-
based, but assets, participation in other programs like TANF 
and SSI, and expenses for things like medical and child 
care are also taken into account. It appears that the number 
of people with household incomes less than 200 percent of 
the poverty line remained relatively constant between 2003 
and 2007, around 32 percent of the population. As noted 
above, the poverty rate remained constant over this period. 
It therefore appears unlikely that an increase in the number 
of SNAP-eligible individuals was the cause for the increase 
in participation during the recovery period before the Great 
Recession. 

An increase in the entry rate is another way the SNAP casel-
oad can increase. There is little evidence that this mechanism 
caused the increase in SNAP caseloads in the mid-2000s. 
Overall, the entry rate into the program remained constant 
among individuals age 15 and over through the period lead-
ing up to the Great Recession, when it increased sharply. On 
average, around 1.25 percent of all individuals over age 15 
entered the program each month before the end of 2007. 
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Figure 2. SNAP Participation Rate, 2001–2010.

Source: Author’s calculations using Survey of Income and Program Participation (SIPP) and U.S. Department of Agriculture data.

Notes: Participation rate defined as percentage of population participating in SNAP. Sample includes the fourth month for each SIPP wave for all individuals. 
SIPP participation rate calculated using monthly average participation rates and Lowess smoothing with a bandwidth of 0.2.
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The final mechanism that could cause an increase in SNAP 
participation is a fall in the exit rate, meaning that once indi-
viduals enter the program, they leave at a decreased rate and 
therefore experience longer participation spells on average. 
The exit rate from SNAP among those over age 15, shown in 
Figure 3, decreased dramatically during the recovery period, 
from around 18 percent in early 2003 to close to 12 percent 
in 2007, a decrease of over 30 percent. The decline appears 
to have been steady over the entire period. The exit rate 
remained around 12 percent through the Great Recession. 
Thus, I conclude that the decrease in the exit rate appears to 
be the main reason for the increase in SNAP participation 
between 2003 and 2007. 

Explaining the decrease in the exit rate

In the next part of my analysis, I attempt to determine the 
reason for the decrease in the SNAP exit rate during 2003 to 
2007. As illustrated above, I believe that this decrease was 
the driving factor behind the increase in SNAP participation 
during a period of economic recovery.

Potential causes

There are at least two potential reasons why the rate at which 
SNAP participants left the program could have decreased 
during a time when the economy was improving: (1) the 
many SNAP policy changes that were implemented during 
the period; and (2) that SNAP participants retained their eli-
gibility longer by experiencing a longer spell of poverty or 

near-poverty. However, since median poverty spell durations 
appear to remain fairly constant over time, longer eligibil-
ity periods do not appear to be a likely explanation for the 
decrease in the exit rate.11 Therefore, I look more closely at 
whether the evidence suggests that the decreased exit rate is 
due to policy changes.

There are a number of different mechanisms through which 
the SNAP policy changes described above could have 
changed the exit rate. Moving to simplified reporting from 
incident reporting or shorter reporting intervals would be 
expected to decrease the exit rate and increase SNAP partici-
pation spell length since a household could keep receiving 
benefits longer even after an income increase as they do not 
have to report their income to the SNAP agency as often. It 
also decreases the cost associated with participating in the 
program, as submitting a report takes time. Increasing the 
certification period length could decrease the exit rate for 
the same reasons lowering reporting requirements could: it 
would allow no-longer-eligible households to keep receiving 
benefits longer and also decrease participation cost.

Finally, expanded categorical eligibility is more likely to 
increase the entry rate into SNAP, as more of the population 
would be eligible for the program. However, it could also 
decrease the exit rate if it allows higher-income households 
to keep their eligibility longer than they would under regular 
categorical eligibility. It has also been shown in numerous 
previous studies to have a strong positive effect on SNAP 
participation.12 The number of states offering expanded cat-
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Figure 3. SNAP Exit Rate, 2001–2010.

Source: Author’s calculations using SIPP data.

Notes: Sample includes the fourth month for each SIPP wave for all individuals. Exit rate calculated using monthly average exit rates and Lowess smoothing 
with a bandwidth of 0.8.
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egorical eligibility remained relatively constant through the 
2003 to 2007 period. Note that other policy changes occurred 
during this period, such as the loosening of the asset test with 
regard to vehicles, the implementation of special SNAP poli-
cies for noncitizens, and the introduction of online electronic 
applications, but these changes would either not be expected 
to affect the exit rate or would not be expected to affect a 
large enough share of the population to change the overall 
exit and participation rate.

In order to attempt to determine whether any of these policy 
changes were responsible for the SNAP exit rate decrease, I 
conducted an empirical hazard analysis. This analysis seeks 
to link the likelihood of exit from SNAP to the presence or 
absence of specific state policies that could theoretically 
affect program exit. However, the theoretically relevant poli-
cies do not have consistent impacts across models, and some 
policies that are not theoretically relevant nonetheless appear 
linked to the likelihood of exiting. As a result, these findings 
make it difficult to reach any firm conclusions about whether 
the decrease in exit rate is due to policy changes.

Conclusions

Based on a descriptive analysis of SNAP participation spells 
using SIPP data, my results indicate that a fall in the rate at 
which participants left the program was likely the primary 
cause of the increase in SNAP participation during the eco-
nomic recovery period of 2003 to 2007. Over this period, the 
entry rate into SNAP as well as the proportion of the popula-
tion eligible for the program did not significantly change. 
The Great Recession, in contrast, saw increases in the entry 
rate and eligibility rate but no further change in the SNAP 
exit rate. While it seems clear from these results that the fall 
in the rate at which participants left the program is at the root 
of the increase in participation, my hazard regression results 
do not provide evidence one way or another that the decline 
in the exit rate can be attributed to SNAP policy changes that 
occurred during the 2003 to 2007 recovery. The explanation 
must lie elsewhere, or the policy variables I currently use 
are not accurately measuring true policy implementation. 
Future research is required to provide a definitive answer to 
this question.n 
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